
Biography of Dr. Shawn Keller

Dr. Shawn Keller, DDS, a pioneer in the field of modern dentistry, heads Smile By Design, a
cutting-edge dental practice located in Kirkland, Washington. His clinic is renowned for utilizing
advanced dental technologies, including a fully equipped dental lab, 3D printers, and milling
machines that produce teeth and bridges, as well as tooth and face scanners. This high-tech
setup allows Dr. Keller to offer customized dental solutions, enabling efficient and precise
treatments tailored to each patient's specific needs.



Smile By Design stands out not only for its technological advancements but also for its unique
family collaboration. Dr. Keller's sister, a skilled digital designer, employs CAD/CAM software to
create detailed 3D models of patients' teeth, ensuring a perfect fit with their facial features. This
capability to pre-design smiles and execute them with 3D printing technology means that
patients can receive their new teeth the same day they are implanted, dramatically reducing the
duration and number of visits required.

Dr. Keller is deeply committed to excellence in dental care, fostering a team of specialists whom
he has personally trained. His clinic's environment, inspired by his love for sci-fi, features Star
Trek and Star Wars motifs, making it a uniquely inviting space for patients. His innovative
approach to dentistry has garnered recognition both locally and nationally, frequently earning
him features in various media outlets as he transforms smiles and impacts lives through
advanced dental care.

The inception of Smile By Design was greatly influenced by Dr. Keller's personal experiences
with chronic pain, which traditional medicine failed to alleviate. Turning to dentistry, he
discovered the root cause of his discomfort was dental, leading to treatment that resolved his
symptoms and inspired him to integrate a holistic approach into his practice. This personal
breakthrough led to the development of his proprietary Same-Day New Smile™ technique,
combining his artistic flair with the precision of modern dental practices to deliver rapid,
life-changing results to his patients.

In addition to general and preventive dentistry, Dr. Keller offers an array of specialized services.
His clinic provides advanced implant options such as zygomatic implants for patients lacking
adequate bone density and biocompatible non-metal implants that offer enhanced holistic
benefits. His cosmetic dentistry services are equally comprehensive, including innovative
treatments like Smile Design and Porcelain Veneers that integrate aesthetic enhancement with
functional restoration.

Dr. Keller's educational background is as distinguished as his professional practice. He
completed his undergraduate studies at Western Washington University, where he earned a
dental degree from the University of Washington School of Dentistry. His expertise was further
honed through a fellowship at the Las Vegas Institute for Advanced Dental Studies and several
international residencies, which provided him with deep insights into dental implantation and 3D
dental Design.

Beyond his practice, Dr. Keller is dedicated to giving back to the community, teaching advanced
dental techniques internationally, and providing much-needed dental care to underprivileged
communities in Mexico and Guatemala. His dedication to his field and humanitarian efforts have
earned him numerous accolades, including pioneering the use of CeraRoot metal-free implants
in Washington state.

Raised in the scenic surroundings of Kirkland and Camano Island, Washington, Shawn Keller's
upbringing in a large, close-knit Catholic family instilled in him a profound appreciation for nature
and community values. His interests, such as golfing, painting, and boating, complement his



professional life, reflecting a well-rounded lifestyle devoted to health, wellness, and continuous
learning. A fervent Seattle Seahawks fan, Dr. Keller embodies the spirit of teamwork and
community engagement, paralleling his professional commitment to enhancing the wellbeing of
his patients through innovative dental care.


